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Reports of TMDU Students in the World

WHAT DO YOU know about Chile? I 
knew almost nothing before I went 
there. In this article, I am going to talk 
about my life in Santiago, the capital of 
Chile. Usually I went to Clinica Las 
Condes (CLC), which is one of the larg-
est hospitals in Chile, at 9 a.m. and usu-
ally went straight to the laboratory. One 
or two supervisors were in charge of 
each student. They taught me how to 
perform my experiments and gave a lot 
of advice. Every Friday, we had a con-
ference in which two of us gave a pre-
sentation about certain topics, which 
were chosen in rotation. Dr. Ito and our 
supervisors also participated in these 
presentations. After the presentation, 
we discussed points which were partic-
ularly important or difficult to under-

stand. On days off, I was able to fully 
enjoy my life in Chile. Some students 
went sightseeing, others held parties 
with students of the University of San-
tiago.

For me, Chile seems very similar to 
Japan. I say this because Chilean people 
often use polite phrases such as “Thank 
you”, “Sorry” and so on. They were so 
kind and cheerful, and helped me when 
I got lost. It was this everyday kindness 
that enabled me to easily adjust to daily 
life in Chile, even though it was my 
fi rst experience of living abroad.

One major difference between Chile 
and Japan is the manner of greeting. 
Chilean people often hug and kiss each 
other when they meet. It seems strange 
to Japanese people that Chilean people 

frequently kiss each others’ cheeks, 
even if they are the same sex. In addi-
tion, “ladies first” is a prevailing cus-
tom. I never saw any Chilean men leav-
ing an elevator ahead of a woman.

For my study, I analyzed the correla-
tion between genetic mutation and 
prognosis for patients with sporadic 
colorectal cancer. First, by using PCR, I 
amplifi ed the DNA of samples such as 
Kras, Braf and PIK3CA, which are con-
cerned with the EGFR pathway. These 
samples were sent to another institution 
for the analysis of DNA sequences and 
compared the result with the wild type 
sequence. I also examined mutations 
using another technique called SSCP in 
order to confi rm the type of mutation. I 
also checked Microsatellite Instability, 
because this is said to be caused by the 
failure of the system of DNA repair, 
and to be related to the prognosis of pa-
tients with colorectal cancer. I am hap-
py to lead a fulfilling life in Santiago, 
and wish to thank all people concerned.

There are a wide variety of exchange programs for young 
people at different levels.

TMDU students and young researchers improve their skills by 
participating in training programs abroad.

My supervisor, Ms.Claudia Paz Hurtado 
Riveros, in the CLC laboratory of oncology 
and molecular genetics.

On Easter Island, made up like Rapa Nui 
people.

Ken Yamagiwa
4th year undergraduate medical student
Project Semester in Chile
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My fi rst experience of staying abroad

TMDU HAS ITS own program called 
“project semester”, in which students 
focus on research. This semester I 
stayed at a laboratory in Clinica Las 
Condes (CLC), which is in Santiago, 
Chile. It is my first visit to a Latin 
American country and my fi rst experi-
ence living in a foreign country for al-
most fi ve months, so life here is full of 
excitement. Let me introduce my life 
here.  
My Experience in the Laboratory
I belonged to the laboratory of oncolo-
gy and molecular genetics, which main-
ly studies sporadic and hereditary 
colorectal cancers and does molecular 
diagnosis of patients in CLC. The at-
mosphere in this laboratory was very 
relaxed and comfortable, and it was a 
very good environment for us research 

beginners, because the staff was very 
kind and answered our questions any-
time. It was my task to detect mutations 
of some putative pathogenic genes of 
Hereditary Nonpolyposis Colorectal 
Cancer (HNPCC) in HNPCC suspected 
patients. It was interesting for me be-
cause this fi eld includes not only genet-
ics but also epigenetics, and I had to 
use a lot of progressive techniques for 
detection. It first, I just followed what 
my supervisors said but fi nally I learned 
how to study by myself and discuss the 
methods and results with my supervi-
sors. I am so happy that I could learn 
both the research techniques, as well as 
important ways of thinking for re-
search.

Life in Chile
Besides joining laboratory activities, 
learning Spanish was another important 
aim for me when I came. Fortunately, I 
made some friends who were almost 
the same age as me, and had a private 
Spanish tutor, so I was able to live and 
learn in Spanish. I found it interesting 
that the characteristics of the Spanish 
languages differ depending on the 
country, just like English does. I want 
to continue studying Spanish even after 
coming back to Japan. I was very sur-

prised to learn that many Chilean peo-
ple know about and are interested in 
Japanese culture, despite the fact that 
Japan is on the other side of the world 
from Chile. Now I feel it is important to 
have abundant knowledge of Japan. For 
me, the experience of studying abroad 
seems to be a good opportunity to re-
vise knowledge of my own country.

 I lived in a house that belongs to a 
Chilean lady. She taught me two things 
that really stuck with me. One was the 
beauty of her country, and she recom-
mended I travel around it as much as 
possible. So far, I was able to visit sea-
side towns such as Valparaiso and Vina 
del Mar. The scenery was very beauti-
ful but the sea was so cold because of 
cold currents. The other was that I was 
not seeing the “real” Chile, because I 
was staying in a rich area, and studying 
in one of the best hospitals in South 
America.  

In closing, I would like to express my 
deepest gratitude to my supervisors for 
giving me this wonderful opportunity to 
study here, and for my meaningful days 
in CLC. I hope more and more students 
will be interested in studying in Chile.

WHAT DO YOU know about Chile? 
Some people know that it is a long and 
narrow country. Some people think that 
Chilean food seems spicy, but it is not 
correct. Other people think that Chile is 
very far away from Japan. That is cor-

rect. It takes more than one day to trav-
el to Chile from Japan via the fastest 
route. When night falls in Japan, dawn 
is breaking in Chile. I celebrated Christ-
mas in the summertime for the first 
time. Chilean people are both sunny 

and shy. On weekends, the city comes 
alive with a very cheerful atmosphere. 
There are many high-rise buildings and 

Mr. Hayashi (center), Japanese ambassador 
in Chile, kindly invited TMDU students to a 
party cerebrating the birthday of Japanese 
Emperor. 

On New Years day on the beach at Con Con
(near Valparaiso). 

Studying at the molecular biology laboratory 
in Clinica Las Condes under the supervision 
of Dr. Torres (left) and Dr. Piemonte (right) 
supervision.

Mayu Sasakawa
4th year undergraduate medical student
Project Semester in Chile
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Encountering, learning, and looking foward

Hironobu Sakurai
4th year undergraduate medical student
Project Semester in Chile

Report 03

From the other side of the world

At the birthday party of Ms. Andrea (far 
right), a LACRC secretary.
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TMDU students and Drs. Nishikage (right) 
and Ito (left) work near the main building of 
CLC.

Background

CHILE IS ON the opposite side of the 
earth to Japan. It takes more than 24 
hours to travel from Japan to Chile, and 
the time difference is 13 hours. I never 
dreamed that I would be here, but now I 
am studying under Dr. Lopez in the 

Laboratory of Oncology and Molecular 
Genetics, Clinica Las Condes (CLC) in 
Chile.

All students in TMDU spend the sec-
ond semester of their 4th year on re-
search. From this year, we were able to 
choose CLC in Chile as a reception 
center. That is why I was fortunate to 
have the opportunity to come to a Latin 
American country.

Since Chile is geographically very 
long from north to south, the climates 
differ according to the different places, 
and each area has an abundant natural 
environment. Santiago, the capital city 
where I’m staying, is located in the 

middle of the country and has a Medi-
terranean climate, which is very com-
fortable for Japanese. The city has a 
very modern infrastructure, and the 
people are very cheerful and kind. 

Study in CLC
CLC is one of the best advanced hospi-
tals in South America, and is located on 
the outskirts of Santiago. Our laborato-
ry is slightly away from the main build-
ings, and there are always three or four 
investigators working there. The re-
searches are so friendly, and teach 

big shopping malls, and many sushi 
restaurants in the city and many Japa-
nese animations on TV. I really enjoyed 
my stay there.

Activity in Chile
Clinica Las Condes (CLC) is the gener-
al hospital in Santiago where I studies 
for five months. We were divided into 
three laboratories. Other students stud-
ied gene analysis or pathologic diagno-
sis for colon cancer. I studied the detec-
tion of bacterial pathogens in infection 
episodes from immunocompromised 
patients using real-time PCR under the 
supervision of Dr. Torres and Dr. Piemon-
te in the molecular biology laboratory. 
The laboratory was fi lled always fi lled 

with excitement and laughter. Many pa-
tient samples are carried continually 
through the laboratory, and emergency 
patient information is often shared 
through a loudspeaker. The lounge, 
however, was always full of jokes, and 
there were many parties to celebrate 
someone’s birthdays, Christmas and 
New Years Day.

Every Friday, we took turns to make 
presentations on topics related to each 
study. We also made presentations for 
interim reports and a fi nal report on our 
studies in the presence of our supervi-
sors, the academic director of CLC and 
a doctor from the University of Chile.

I had many exciting experiences out-
side the laboratory. I had the opportuni-
ty to meet the Chilean Ambassador to 
Japan before coming to Chile and the 
Japanese Ambassador to Chile at a re-
ception in the Japanese Ambassador’s 
residence. I visited tourist sites and 
traveled to Easter Island with other stu-
dents and friends in Chile. I also ended 
up gong to CLC and receiving medical 
treatment as a patient, which could be 
seen as both fortunate and unfortunate. 

I was also able to gain an insight into 
the differences in medicine between Ja-
pan and Chile. 

I feel there are many cultural differ-
ences between Japan and Chile. People 
in Chile are often unpunctual, and I 
needed to raise my hand for a bus to 
stop, which was sometimes ignored. 
These differences made me confused, 
and I experienced a few problems be-
cause of them. However, all of my ex-
periences both good and bad were very 
important for me. Living overseas for 
such a long time forced me to commu-
nicate with my poor English. I saw the 
fi rst sunrise of the New Year in a differ-
ent country. I hope that these experienc-
es will be a great help for my own fu-
ture development. 

Special Thanks
I am very grateful to Dr. Torres, Dr. 
Piemonte and others in the laboratory 
for teaching me, also to the staff in the 
other laboratories and CLC for their 
kindness in helping me. I would also 
like to thank Dr. Olivi for treating me, 
and to Andrea-san in LACRC for sup-
porting me at anytime on anything.

“Fiesta de Navidad” The staff from the labo-
ratories invited me to a Christmas party. We 
exchanged presents with each other.

Yuki Nakamura
4th year undergraduate medical student
Project Semester in Chile
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My life in Latin America

I STAYED in Santiago, the capital of 
Chile, and studied in Clinica Las 
Condes(CLC), one of the most sophisti-
cated private hospital in South America, 
from October 2010 to February 2011. 
This period is the middle of summer in 
Chile, so the weather was very hot with 
little rain, and it remained bright out-
side from 7 a.m. to 9 p.m. Because I love 

summer so much, this climate was the 
perfect place for me to be. 

In CLC, I belonged to pathological 
laboratory and studied neuroendocrine 
tumors in the lung. From Monday to 
Friday, I reviewed cases under the mi-
croscope by myself in the morning and 
checked them with my professors, Ta-
kashi Ito and Antonio Piottante, in the 
afternoon. On January 26, while writing 
this, I was also analyzing the data I had 
collected to date in order to write a pa-
per. Neuroendocrine tumors of the lung 
such as lung carcinoid are a very rare 
disease, and it was difficult for me to 
collect many cases. But despite these 
problems, I did the best I could. Addi-
tionally, I took a personal interest in 
Ulcerative colitis, and used my spare 

time to see many cases of this in CLC. I 
was able to gain more pathological 
knowledge of infl ammatory bowel dis-
ease than I did in Japan. 

In my daily life in Chile, I lived with 
a Chilean mother, brother, and two Ec-
uadorian women who came to Chile for 
a short period in order to study radiolo-
gy. I managed to communicate with 
them by using my broken Spanish and 
body language because no one could 
speak English. However, they were 
very kind to me, and treat me as if I was 
their son or brother. My Chilean host 
mother usually cooked Chilean food for 
me. My favorite food is cazuela, which 
is a stew containing rice, meat and 
many vegetables. It was very delicious. 
After studying in CLC, I went to the 

Dr. Antonio Piottante (left), a pathologist in 
CLC.

about life in Chile as well as about our 
research projects. We also teach them 
about Japan, so the laboratory feels like 
we are always in a cultural exchange 
between Chile and Japan. 

In the laboratory, I am exploring mu-
tations of the BMPR1A gene, which is 
a cause of polyposis syndromes, using 
polymerase chain reaction (PCR), sin-
gle strand conformation polymorphism 
(SSCP), and DNA sequencing. This 
study is a part of a project in which we 

are trying to standardize the diagnosis 
of colorectal cancer, and it is very im-
portant for the treatment of colorectal 
cancer.

Students often discuss results with 
laboratory supervisors, and presenta-
tions to one another each week. It is 
diffi cult to give a presentation on tech-
nical details in English. However, the 
opportunity for deepening our collec-
tive knowledge about the studies is ex-
cellent experience and academically 
stimulating. 

Life in Chile
The period from October to February is 
spring and summer in Chile, so it’s very 
comfortable for me. People stay awake 
later at night because of the late sunset, 
so I also feel very active after working 
even on a weekday, and enjoy a drink 
with my new Chilean friends every 
week. Chilean people are so generous, 
cheerful and talkative. On weekends or 

holidays, I sometimes visit museums, 
go to the movies, and sometimes go 
sightseeing in places outside Santiago, 
such as Easter Island, Patagonia and so 
on.

My life in Santiago was very fulfi ll-
ing, but I run into a language barrier 
with Spanish. However, as I studied 
some Spanish in my free time, I am 
now able to communicate more in 
Spanish. Of course I always carry a dic-
tionary, but for the most part I can com-
municate with even gestures.

To live in the foreign country which 
has a different language and institutions 
from Japan is a great stimulus for me to 
think again about myself and Japanese 
culture. I would like to put this precious 
experience to good use throughout the 
rest of my life. Finally, I would like to 
express my deepest gratitude to all the 
people that helped me through this pro-
gram.

A trip to the Easter Island in December. There 
are hundreds of moai on Easter Island.

My host mother, TMDU students, and me

Masaki Shimamoto
4th year undergraduate medical student
Project Semester in Chile

5-month study in Clinica Las Condes, 
Santiago, Chile

Report 05

Santiago has a Mediterranean climate and 
the people are cheerful and kind.
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gym two or three times a week. I was 
able to make many new Chilean friends 
in the gym. They were very friendly 
and talked to me, even though I couldn’
t speak Spanish very well. And I was 
much surprised that they were more 
stoical to their training than I expected. 
I was happy to be able to go training with 
them.

Every Tuesday, some friends and I 

learned Spanish with a Spanish teacher. 
I think Spanish is very difficult lan-
guage to acquire, because its conjuga-
tion is much more confusing than Eng-
lish. However, as it is such a rare oppor-
tunity to live in a Spanish-speaking part 
of America, I wanted to acquire as 
many skills as possible while there. 
Furthermore, we were invited to a re-
ception in the embassy of Chile and met 

Dinner at a Japanese restaurant in Santiago. 
Six Japanese students who studied at CLC, 
two doctors who are working at CLC and 
their wives, and the secretary

IN THE SECOND HALF of our 4th 
year, we have the opportunity to do re-
search. During this research period, we 
have a variety of different options. 
Some students decided to stay in Japan 
to do research, and others go abroad to 
do research. Fortunately, I had the 
chance to go abroad, and so I chose to 
come to Chile. I chose Chile because I 
thought that going to Chile would be a 
personal challenge. As most people in 
Chile speak Spanish, living in Chile 
was hard for me because I don’t speak 
Spanish. There are also not so many 
Japanese people in Chile, so I thought 
this would make my life even harder. I 
belonged to the pathological laboratory 
at Clinica Las Condes (CLC), and my 
research program was to investigate 
pathological findings about colorectal 
cancer as prognostic factors. I was 
mainly taught by Dr. Contreras, with 
support from Dr. Ito. I learned a lot in 
the laboratory.

As I had thought, life in Chile was 
hard for me, especially for the first 
month. Everything was new for me, and 
as I needed a dictionary to talk to peo-
ple, I hardly talked with others and of-
ten felt very nervous. But Chileans are 
very kind, and gradually I got use to 
daily life. However, at the end of my 
stay in Chile, I didn’t need to take a 
dictionary with me, I could speak some 
Spanish, and I didn’t feel as nervous as 
I did at the start. 

Finally as I was able to speak Span-
ish, I really enjoyed my time there and I 
think this was thanks to my Chilean 
friends. They are students of translation 
at university, and as they are studying 
Japanese translation they can speak 
Spanish, English, and Japanese. It was 
a very good for us, because they could 
teach us Spanish, and we could teach 
them Japanese. Soon we became good 
friends, and we enjoyed spending time 
together. For example, one of them in-

vited us to his house and made Chilean 
food for us, then I invited them to my 
house and made Japanese food for 
them. We celebrated the start of the 
New Year on New Years Day together. 
We taught them how Japanese people 
spend New Year, and they taught us 
how Chilean people spend New Years 
Day. We met almost every weekend, 
and enjoyed going to the beach, bars, 
dancing, shopping, and so on. I really 
appreciate their friendship, because 
they made my life in Chile very com-
fortable and enjoyable.

I had such a good experience in 
Chile, and now feel that Chile is my 
home away from home. I really appre-
ciate the help I got from everyone who 
I met in Chile, and I also really appreci-
ate TMDU because they provided me 
with this wonderful opportunity. 

with the Japanese Ambassador to Chile. 
We also traveled to Easter Island and 
Patagonia, and enjoyed the wonderful 
natural scenery of Chile. 

This is the first time for me to live 
and study in a foreign country for such 
a long period. Although I ran into many 
diffi culties, I think it was an extremely 
good experience for me to cultivate 
many new skills.

Lunch at a Chilean restaurant 
in Concon, on the way to our 
friend’s house. five Japanese 
students from CLC and four 
students from USACH (Univer-
sidad de Santiago de Chile) 

Field activity of collecting tsetse fly, inter-
mediate hosts for African trypanosome par-
asites.

SINCE JANUARY 6, we have been in 
Ghana researching Trypanosoma, the 
causal parasites of African Sleeping 
Disease (ASD). In developing countries 
such as Ghana, rare diseases are still 
endemic, and have been plaguing peo-
ple’s lives, animals, and the economy 
for many years. ASD is a devastating 
disease with few cures. Left untreated, 
the final outcome of the disease is 
death. Little progress has been made in 
developing new drugs, and available 
drugs have strong side effects. There-
fore it is very important to research 
Trypanosoma and the tsetse fly, the 
main vector of Trypanosoma. 

We are working in the Noguchi Me-
morial Institute for Medical Research 
(NMIMR) in Accra, the capital of Gha-
na. NMIMR was founded in 1979 in 
memory of the late Dr. Hideyo Noguchi, 
who died of yellow fever in Accra in 
1928. Under a Japanese researcher Dr. 
Suzuki Takashi, myself and one other 
TMDU student are investigating the 
motion of Trypanosoma by using RNAi 
analysis. 

Research into new drug targets for 
trypanocidal effects are also being con-
ducted. Additionally, taking advantage 
of being in Ghana, we have collected 
tsetse fl ies from rural villages near Ac-

cra. Using these samples, we will detect 
trypanosome in the fl ies and determine 
the percentage of tsetse flies infected 
with trypanosome. This data will con-
tribute to understanding the complex 
interaction between tsetse fl ies and try-
panosome in a given geological setting. 
Such kinds of study are diffi cult to im-
plement in Japan. 

In Ghana, we were able to see vari-
ous facilities in addition to working in 
the laboratory. During our stay, we had 
a chance to see a hospital in Ghana. We 
visited a provincial hospital, which is 
located about 100km away from Accra. 
We were able to see a hospital in Kwa-
hu, a rural area of Ghana. The hospital 
staff members were nice to us, but the 
big differences in sanitary conditions 
between Japanese and Ghanaian hospi-
tals shocked us, and made us consider 
the importance of hygiene education for 
medical doctors and nurses. We learned 
about the standards of medical care in 
Ghana, and found they are very differ-
ent to Japanese standards. A local doc-
tor kindly allowed us to view his diag-
nosis.

However, there was no difference in 
how medical staff think between Ghana 
and Japan. Ghanaian doctors and nurses 
do their best for their patients, and see-

Ayumu Nomizu
4th year undergraduate medical student
Project Semester in Chile
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My wonderful life in Chile

Laboratory works on trypano-
somiasis with Dr. Suzuki in the 
Noguchi Institute

Lots of fresh seafood at Mercado 
Central in Santiago.

ing this increased our motivation to be 
good doctors/researchers, contributing 
to the health and welfare of our people.

Because of the diet that is based on 
oily foods and insufficient nutrition, 
there were many outpatients with dia-
betes mellitus, hypertension, and cardi-
ac problems. We noticed that there were 
increasing demands on primary health 
care education in developing countries. 
The hospital tour was so impressive for 
us as medical students. 

In TMDU, all 4th year medical stu-
dents are assigned to a laboratory in the 
second semester. I chose the laboratory 
of Parasitology, and have studied para-
sitology under Professor Nobuo Ohta, a 
prominent parasitologist. This Ghana 
visit is the part of our study. Ghana is a 
very interesting country. The roads are 
filled with luxury cars, but along the 
sides of the roads, there are many ped-
dlers, street children, and beggars. The 
gap between rich and poor is getting 
wider, and the vulnerable people are be-
coming increasingly left behind. We 
were given a fi rst-hand view of the state 
of developing countries. Meeting with 
Japanese people living in Ghana is also 
a valuable experience. Talks with peo-
ple in trading fi rms, doctors in the Japa-
nese embassy, and officers in JICA 
taught us a lot. 

This kaleidoscopic two-month expe-
rience taught us so much, and we great-
ly appreciate TMDU for the opportuni-
ty they gave us. According to Dr. Suzuki, 
TMDU students will be able to research 
Malaria parasites in NMIMR from next 
year. We strongly recommend other 
Japanese medical students come and 
see Ghana.

Wataru Kagaya, Tomoki Kawahara
4th year undergraduate medical student
Project Semester in Ghana 
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Our short stay in Ghana
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Seiji Noda
4th year undergraduate medical student
Exchange program in U.K.
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Establishing goals and expressing my opinion

Short trip to Stonehenge. It is a designated a 
World Heritage Site that dates back to 2,500 
B.C.

I transduced target genes into cells using the 
molecular biological method, and analyzed 
them using electrophysiological techniques.

I APPLIED FOR this exchange pro-
gram because I thought it is a good 
chance to broaden my outlook by study-
ing abroad over a long period, as well 
as learning more about research. As my 
stay at Imperial is coming to an end, I 

would like to look back on these five 
months and reflect on what I have 
learned. 

This year, we joined research projects 
without taking lectures. As I am inter-
ested in neuroscience, I selected a re-

search project related to neurons that 
release a hormone which regulates ap-
petite in the surgery and anesthesia de-
partment. My laboratory belongs to the 

We visited Seven Sisters in Eastbourne. 
Beautiful chalk cliffs extending along the 
English Channel.

biophysics section, and I mainly carried 
out experiments using molecular biolo-
gy and electrophysiological methods. 

During this program, I was able to 
learn a lot about the background of my 
project and related expertise from my 
supervisor and other members in the 
laboratory. In particular, describing my 
project in an English report enabled me 
to gain a deeper understanding of the 
meaning of experiments that I have 
done so far. These experiences enabled 
me to understand the essential parts of 
research (reading, discussion and think-
ing strategy) as well as technical as-
pects. In addition, I was able to in-
crease my level of English by commu-
nicating with many people from various 
backgrounds. Sharing experiences and 
thoughts with them will motivate me to 
keep studying medicine and other sub-
jects.

If I was asked to identify the most 
important thing I have learned during 
these fi ve months, I would answer it is 
the importance and necessity of estab-
lishing my own goals and expressing 

myself appropriately. The more I talked 
with people, the more I realized my at-
titude was too passive. I think it is due 
to not only to my Japanese personality, 
but also to my attitude to study. I real-
ized this attitude problem could become 
a fatal fl aw when I have to manage ev-
erything about my research or clinical 
work as a doctor, especially if I have to 
work in a foreign country. I noticed it is 
essential that I make aims and reason-
ing very clear, because it is diffi cult for 
me to describe precisely what I am 
thinking in English. Having clear goals 
enables us to decide effectively what 
should be done in limited time. 

Even when I speak and write in Eng-
lish, I still think in Japanese. It is natu-
ral and I won’t be able to change this 
fact no matter how long I keep learning 
English after this program. Of course, I 
think command of English is an impor-
tant requirement for medicine and sci-
ence. However, it is no use speaking 
English fluently if the only things I 
have in my mind are untrustworthy, 
empty and unimportant. 

From this April, I will start clinical 
practice in hospital. In this way, this pe-
riod gave me the perfect opportunity to 
consider my ideals as a doctor in more 
detail. I do not know whether I will 
study abroad in the future. However, I 
think this exchange program is a valu-
able chance for me to learn many things 
as a student. I will make good use of 
my experiences gained from these fi ve 
months in the future, and provide what 
I have learnt and experienced as much 
as possible to my juniors. 

Finally, I would like to thank every-
one allowed me to take this precious 
opportunity.

Discussion about the result of western blot 
analysis with my supervisor, Margareta Nikolic 
in a laboratory at Hammersmith Hospital.

I HAVE BEEN studying in Imperial 
College London as an exchange student 
since last October. I would like to talk 
about my experience of these fi ve months 
here.

The biggest reason why I applied for 
this course was to learn how research-
ers organized and performed experi-
ments. I took a neuroscience project on 
multiple sclerosis (MS) as my research 
issue. This disease is thought to be an 
autoimmune inflammatory disease 
causing demyelination of nerves and a 
wide variety of neurological symptoms. 
This research, however, focused on the 
neurodegenerative aspect of MS, which 
remains incompletely understood. A 
huge motivation was the thought that 
anything I found during this research 
would be completely new to the fi eld. 

In the beginning, almost everything 

went smoothly. The results I obtained 
corresponded with what I had expected, 
and interpreting the data was not so dif-
fi cult. However, after tackling some un-
expected results, I learned that we need 
to push our range of knowledge in or-
der to rise to the occasion. Whether you 
can learn something from a failure and 
solve the problem or not purely de-
pends on your approach to the problem. 
The standard way of thinking would be 
simply to think you made a mistake, 
and to repeat the experiment. However, 
if you have special knowledge in the 
field such as protein kinetics or the 
functions of each reagent used in the 
protocol, however, you might fi nd some 
changes, which seemingly did not exist. 
You may also fi nd defects in your pro-
tocol, and may need to modify it. Read-
ing relevant papers in not just about in-
creasing knowledge, but it is also about 
understanding how the author, and to 
refl ect this in your own project. It may 
seem simple, but I believe this is one of 
the most important aspects of research 
that should never be forgotten. 

Now I am writing up my report of 
this research. Every researcher tries to 
publish a good paper in English so that 
their ideas become known internation-

ally, and so for me, this represents the 
start of my career. I realize increasingly 
more that brushing up my paper is help-
ing me appreciate more of my own re-
search. 

On top of this great experience relat-
ed to my research, interactions with 
people here were a precious experience 
for me as well. The college itself re-
ceives a lot of international students 
from countries all over the world, and 
in my laboratory, there are people from 
many countries working together. Com-
municating with those people increased 
my interest in other countries. Above 
all, I was very happy to hold a reunion 
with exchange students who came to 
our college in Japan last year. I partici-
pated as a volunteer to give a tour and 
hold a welcome party for them. They 
remembered me and told us about their 
fulfilling experiences in Japan. I think 
the opportunity to build friendships 
with people in other countries is one of 
the great aspects of this exchange pro-
gram.

On a fi nal note, I would like express 
my gratitude to all the people who sup-
ported this marvelous program.

Yuma Noguchi
4th year undergraduate medical student
Exchange program in U.K.

Report 08

The place where my career started

Satoshi Shoji
6th year undergraduate medical student
Clinical Clerkship at Harvard University

Report 10

When stroke patients are hospitalized

I had a chance to experience surgery.
MY CLINICAL EXPERIENCE in Bos-
ton were really exciting and brilliant. I 
studied neurology, transplant and anes-
thesia at Massachusetts General Hospi-
tal (MGH), and participated as one of 
the team members. These experiences 
were sometimes really tough, but also 
really exciting because I had almost the 

same responsibilities as the Harvard 
medical students.

The biggest difference I found be-
tween the Japanese medical system and 
American system was that residents are 
always evaluated by patients, senior at-
tending, teammates and even students, 
which leads to advanced quality of medi-

cal care and medical education for resi-
dents. Doctors also have a wide range 
of specialist help, including nurses, 
practitioners, and physical therapists, 
enabling doctors to focus on the “cure” 
for their patients. 

However, their work is so specialized 
and subdivided that I sometimes saw 
problems occur between doctors and 
patients. For example, when a stroke 
patient is hospitalized, they are treated 
by neurologists, as well as ID (infec-
tious disease) doctors, nurses and nutri-
tionists, so the patients are often con-
fused about whom their attending is. With Harvard team members; I am 

fourth from left in the back row.

Enjoy playing baseball with teammates.
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Furthermore, when I compare the 
quality of the Harvard educational sys-
tem for medical student, I don’t think 
TMDU is inferior to Harvard. Instead, 
the critical difference is that Harvard 
students are always proactive, they tru-
ly participate in the team and do almost 
the same work as residents. Their atti-
tude towards clinical clerkship was re-

ally impressive, so I strongly believe 
that makes their clerkship more mean-
ingful.

I also had many opportunities to talk 
with Japanese doctors in Boston during 
my stay. Some doctors gave me excel-
lent advice about my future path, which 
broadened my options as a doctor. 

I am sure that this experience will 

broaden my future career possibilities, 
and make me much more proactive. It 
also makes me feel that I will try to 
make an international career. I would 
really like to thank my classmates and 
doctors for giving me such a special ex-
perience, and want to recommend all 
juniors make full use of this wonderful 
opportunity.

Kazuya Yamaguchi
6th year undergraduate medical student
Clinical Clerkship at Harvard University

Report 11

Welcome to Japan!

THANKS TO THE exchange program, 
I was able to do a clinical clerkship at 
Harvard Medical School hospital for 
three months. It was the most exciting 
and fantastic experience of my life.

I rotated between three specialties. 
They were Pediatric Neurology, Pediat-
ric Surgery and Radiology. Each team I 
belonged to consisted of an attending, 
resident and nurse practitioner. My 
main duties were to be in charge of 
some patients, and to make presenta-
tions about their conditions. Especially 
in the surgery, I was able to participate 
in operations every day. The doctors al-
so gave us a lot of interesting lectures.

Through this program, I realized 
three points. First of all, Harvard hospi-
tals gather superior human resources 
from all over the world. I talked to doc-
tors from India, China, Europe and 
America. They are really enthusiastic 
and develop their skills through friend-
ly competition. I cannot see such multi-
national scenes here in Japan. Certainly 
the medical services and studies done 
America are top in the world, but they 

are done not only by Americans, but al-
so by superior professionals from 
throughout the world. 

Second, people studying at Harvard 
are really good at making presentations. 
There are many opportunities for those 
studying at Harvard to give presentations 
on rounds and during lectures, so they 
can learn how to make good presenta-
tions and attract the attention of the au-
dience. Japanese people tend to be rath-
er shy, and poor at giving presentations. 
We tend to speak to PC monitors. What 
we need is to look at the audience, read 
the faces of our audience, and think 
how to attract their attention. Though it 
is not polite to sell ourselves strongly in 
Japanese society, we need to develop 
these presentation skills to gain interna-
tional credit. 

Finally, Japanese medical technology 
is also at a high level compared with 
that of America. Although I was sur-
prised to see the latest operating ma-
chine known as “Davinci”, most of the 
other machines and treatments are simi-
lar to those used in Japan. Our consid-

eration of symptoms and differential di-
agnoses are also very similar. I fi nd this 
fascinating because Japan is a small is-
land country, and these skills were de-
veloped uniquely by senior Japanese 
doctors. Of course, some of these doc-
tors studies abroad to bring back vari-
ous specialized skills and knowledge, 
but they are the ones that created mod-
ern day Japan.  

Now, America remains top of the 
world for medical treatment and re-
search. China is also developing rapidly 
with their huge manpower. How about 
Japan? Can we keep this position in the 
future? Though we have a good base in 
our senior doctors, we have neither the 
international human resources nor man-
power. I think that we need to use Eng-
lish to continue developing. We need 
English to catch up with the latest tech-
nologies, which are produced all over 
the world, and to invite brilliant re-
searchers to Japan. I know that Japan is 
fi lled with the Japanese language and it 
might be diffi cult for foreigners to live 
here for a long time. But the number of 
people who can speak English well is 
increasing, and we are gradually getting 
used to talking with foreigners. If you 
are interested in Japan, please come and 
visit Japan. Of course I also want to visit 
your country in the future. So I guess all I 
really want to say is, welcome to Japan!

Members of TMDU 
family at Harvard 
Medical School

With two great residents at Pediatric Sur-
gery 

A BIG CHRISTMAS tree was designed using 
building lights from 9th to 24th fl oor (100m) on 
south side of M&D Tower on Dec. 24, 2010. 
This event was made possible based on three ma-
jor conditions: Low cost, no interference with 
study and research, and cooperation from all 
TMDU students, professors and staff members. 
The Christmas tree was created manually using 
only the “ON” and “OFF” switches for room 
lights, and opening and closing of the blinds 
shades.
Although the Christmas tree was illuminated for 
only 45 minutes from 6:15 p.m. onwards, many 
people around the University enjoyed the surprise 
Christmas present from TMDU. A lot of people 
stopped to look and take pictures of the tree, and 
enjoyed seeing the illumination in the Christmas 
night sky.

Gigantic Christmas Tree
on

the Christmas Eve

C O L U M N

The Christmas tree designed on M&D Tower and TMDU’s 
main campus buildings at Yushima. The picture was tak-
en at Ochanomizu-bashi, in front of TMDU buildings. 
Many people stopped to look when they noticed the tree.


